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Bonegilla Store Buildings Army Nos. 0462/028 and
029

Building Trades Store (No.
029), from the north west

Location

Latchford Barracks BONEGILLA, Wodonga City

Municipality

WODONGA CITY

Level of significance

-

Heritage Listing

Vic. War Heritage Inventory

Heritage Study/Consultant Wodonga - Wodonga Heritage Study Stage 1, Freeman Randell, 2004; 

Construction dates 1950, 

Hermes Number 125547

Property Number



Physical Description 1

A pair of matching small rectangular store sheds, part of the Building Trades or Building Barn Area located south
of the main buildings cluster at Latchford. These sheds appear to have been built c1950s or 1960s. They have
walls and gable roofs clad with large-corrugation galvanised sheet steel, possibly intended to be lost-form
formwork for the underside of suspended concrete floors but adapted to replace normal corrugated iron sheets in
this application. The corrugations are several times larger than those in normal corrugated iron, and each large
corrugation is ribbed with numerous small corrugations like ripple-iron. The framing appears to be cold-formed
galvanised sheet steel channels or C-sections. There are six steel-framed louvre windows along each long side.
At one end there are two doors made of the same large-corrugation sheet steel, and an extension of the gable
roof to form a canopy over the doorway. The sheds are in good condition.

Physical Conditions

Good condition

Veterans Description for Public

Bonegilla Store Buildings (Army Nos. 0462/028 & 029) comprise of a pair of matching small rectangular store
sheds, part of the Building Trades or Building Barn Area located south of the main buildings at Latchford. The
sheds have walls and gable roofs clad with large-corrugation galvanised sheet steel, possibly intended to be lost-
form formwork for the underside of suspended concrete floors but adapted to replace normal corrugated iron
sheets in this application. The corrugations are several times larger than those in normal corrugated iron, and
each large corrugation is ribbed with numerous small corrugations like ripple-iron. The framing appears to be
cold-formed galvanised sheet steel channels or C-sections. There are six steel-framed louvre windows along
each long side. At one end there are two doors made of the same large-corrugation sheet steel, and an extension
of the gable roof to form a canopy over the doorway.

This place/object may be included in the Victorian Heritage Register pursuant to the Heritage Act 2017. Check
the Victorian Heritage Database, selecting 'Heritage Victoria' as the place source.

For further details about Heritage Overlay places, contact the relevant local council or go to Planning Schemes
Online http://planningschemes.dpcd.vic.gov.au/
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